
408 HISTOEY OF GLOUCESTEE.

CHAPTER XXII.

Declaration of Independence. — Toavn consents to a State Con

stitution. — Loan for the Poor. — Enlistment. — The Privateer
" Warren." — Other Privateers. — State Armed Vessels. — Town-
Meeting. — Large Class of Poor. — Loss of the Privateer
"Gloucester." — Dr. Samuel Rogers. — Privateer " Speedavell."

— State Constitution rejected. — The Toavn delinquent. — A
Company raised. — Small-Pox. — The Privateer "Starks."— Dis
tressed Condition of the Toafn. —Depreciated Currency and
Exorbitant Prices. —Third Cruise of the " Starks." — Notice of
other Privateers. — Loss of the " Tempest." — True History

OF Revolutionary Privateering a Sad One.

The adAT.ce and sympathy of the wise and good pastor— the
subject of the preceding chapter — were, at this time, of great
value. Questions of grave importance were constantly arising,
which, together with the distressed condition of many famihes
In the town, caUed Into exercise aU the Arisdom, courage, and
benevolence of our fathers. The war had borne vrith great

severity upon them ; but they did not waver for a moment in
the support of thefr principles. On the 24th of June, the great
question of a declaration of independence by Congress came
before them at a large toAvn-meetIng caUed on purpose to con

sider it; and they voted rmanimously, if that body should
resolve upon the measure, to support them in it Arith thefr Hves
and fortunes. In ten days, the Declaration was proclaimed to
the world. The immortal document was read from aU the pul

pits of Gloucester, and copied into the records of the toAvn.
Another subject of great interest at this time was a form of
government for Massachusetts, which came before our citizens

on the 20th of September ; when they voted thefr consent, that
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